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East London
NHS Foundation Trust

Information Governance
The Green

1 Roger Dowley Court
Russia Lane

London

E2 9NJ

Email elft.foi@nhs.net
Website: https:/Mmww.elft.nhs.uk

7 December 2021
Our reference: FOI DA3759
I am responding to your request for information received 12 April 2021 which you
clarified on 11 May 2021. | am sorry for the delay in responding to your request. This
has been treated as a request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
I am now enclosing a response which is attached to the end of this letter. Please do
not hesitate to contact me on the contact details above if you have any further

queries.

Yours sincerely,

ooy

Keshia Harvey
Information Governance Manager

If you are dissatisfied with the Trust's response to your FOIA request then you should contactus and we will arrange
for an internal review of this decision.

If you remain dissatisfied with the decision following our response to your complaint, you may write to the Information
Commissioner for a decision under Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. The Information Commissioner
can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner’s Office
Wy cliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113
Web: www.ico.org.uk

Please note that the data supplied is not allowed to be re-used and/or published without the explicit
consent of East London NHS Foundation Trust. Please contact the signatory to request permission if this
is your intention

Chair: Mark Lam Chief Executive: Paul Calaminus

We care We respect We are tinclusive
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Request:

Question 1.

Answer:

Question 2.

Answer:

Question 3.
Answer:

Question 4.

Answer:

Chair: Mark Lam

We care

How many have died of covid-19 (having no otherillnesses
presentin their bodies at the time),the racial breakdown of those
who died and their ages to date?

11 patients died with no other iliness recorded or reported at the time
of their deaths

Patients were between the age of 58 and 95 years

5 White British
3 Bangladeshi
2 Black Caribbean
1 Asian Other

How many people have died WITH covid-19 who had other
sicknesses (co-morbidities at the time of death), the racial
breakdown and their age to date?

There were 281 deaths where the patient died within 28 days of
testing positive for COVID 19 present as well as other pre —conditions.

The age range of deaths was between the ages of 58 years and 100
years

167 White British

30 Black British

19 deaths where ethnicity was either not stated, not known or is yet to
be confirmed by the reporter of the death
17 Bangladeshi

13 Asian Other

11 African

8 British Bangladeshi

3 Indian

3 Pakistani

2 Chinese

2 Indian British

2 Irish

2 Sheik

2 White mixed

How many staff work for ELFT?
6337 staff work for East London NHS Foundation Trust.

How many staff have died of covid-19 (having no other illnesses
presentin their bodies at the time),the racial breakdown of those
who died and their ages to date?

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds
information of the description specified in the request, and

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.

Chief Executive: Paul Calaminus

We respect We are unclusive



Question 5.

Answer:

Question 6.

Answer:

Question 7.

Answer:

Question 8.

Answer:

Question 9.

Answer:

Chair: Mark Lam

We care

Although the Trust is aware when a death in service occurs, the
reason for death is not required or given. Thisinformation is therefore
not held so we regret we are unable to respond to this question.

How many staff have died WITH covid-19who had other
sicknesses (co-morbidities at the time), the racial breakdown of
those who died and their ages to date?

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds
information of the description specified in the request, and

(b) ifthat is the case, to have that information communicated to him.

Although the Trust is aware when a death in service occurs, the
reason for death is not required or given. Thisinformation is therefore
not held so we regret we are unable to respond to this question.

How many staff have received what a 'vaccine' treatment? Please
advise which the names of the suppliers of the 'vaccine' used?

5,229 staff members have self-reported to have received the first dose
and 4,865 self-reported to have received the second dose.

It is not mandatory for staff to declare which vaccine they have
received for Trust records therefore we are unable to provide a
breakdown by vaccine type.

How many staff have had an adverse reaction (within 1 month)
following receipt of the 'vaccine'?

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled—

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds
information of the description specified in the request, and

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.

The Trust does not hold this information and therefore, it is not
disclosable.

How many 'vaccines' have been delivered to the community?

As of 21 November 2021, the Trust has administered 161,093
vaccines. Please note that this includes staff and those in the
community.

How many people in the community have had adverse reaction
(within 1 month) following receipt of the 'vaccine'?

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states:

Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled—

Chief Executive: Paul Calaminus
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Question 10.

(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds

information of the description specified in the request, and

(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.

The Trust does not hold this information and therefore, it is not
disclosable.

month from October 2020to March 2021.

Please advise about percentages of staff sickness levels for each

Clarification: Please advise of all sickness
Answer: Please see table below:
October | November | December | January | February | March
2020 2020 2020 2021 2021 2021
5.51% 6.34% 7.11% 9.59% 6.66% 6.04%

Chair: Mark Lam
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