Information Governance
The Green
1 Roger Dowley Court
Russia Lane
London
E2 9NJ
Email elft.foi@nhs.net
Website: https://www.elft.nhs.uk
25 May 2021

Our reference: FOI DA3785

I am responding to your request for information received 26 April 2021 which you
clarified on 19 May 2021. This has been treated as a request under the Freedom of
Information Act 2000.
I am now enclosing a response which is attached to the end of this letter. Please do
not hesitate to contact me on the contact details above if you have any further
queries.
Yours sincerely,

Keshia Harvey
Information Governance Manager
If you are dissatisfied with the Trust’s response to your FOIA request then you should contact us and we will arrange
for an internal review of this decision.
If you remain dissatisfied with the decision following our response to your complaint, you may write to the
Information Commissioner for a decision under Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. The Information
Commissioner can be contacted at:
Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF
Tel: 0303 123 1113
Web: www.ico.org.uk
Please note that the data supplied is not allowed to be re-used and/or published without the explicit
consent of East London NHS Foundation Trust. Please contact the signatory to request permission if
this is your intention

Chair: Mark Lam

Chief Executive: Paul Calaminus

Request:
Dear Sir/Madam,
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following
information regarding locked rehabilitation placements for adults with a range
of mental health problems.
Where possible, please kindly include responses on the attached spreadsheet.
Question 1.

Please could you supply the name, email address and telephone
number of the commissioner with responsibility for placements
in locked rehabilitation.

Answer:

The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.
Section 1(1) of the FOI Act states:
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds
information of the description specified in the request, and
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.
East London NHS Foundation Trust is a mental health and community
health trust and not a commissioner Trust. We therefore do not hold
the information requested.

For questions 2 through 7, please supply the following information for the
financial years 2018/19 to 2020/21, and budgeted information for 2021/22.
Question 2.

Please provide the total number of adults funded by the Trust in
locked rehabilitation.

Question 3.

Of the total number of adults funded by the Trust in locked
rehabilitation (q.2) please provide the number that are male and
the number that are female.

Question 4.

Of the total number of adults funded by the Trust in locked
rehabilitation (q.2) please provide the number that were detained
under the Mental Health Act and the number that were admitted
on an informal basis.

Question 5.

Of the total number of adults funded by the Trust in locked
rehabilitation (q.2) please provide the number that were placed
‘in area’ and the number that were placed ‘out of area’.

Question 6.

Of the total number of adults funded by the Trust in locked
rehabilitation (q.2) please provide the number that were placed in
NHS provision and the number that were placed in independent
provision.

Question 7.

Of the total number of adults funded by the Trust in locked
rehabilitation (q.2) please provide the number presenting with a
learning disability, a mental illness, an acquired brain injury, a
neurological condition, or a personality disorder.
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Question 8.

Please provide the Trust’s total expenditure on locked
rehabilitation placements for the financial years 2018/19 to
2020/21, and budgeted information for 2021/22. If expenditure for
2017/18 is not yet available, please provide projected
expenditure.

Clarification:
There is no set definition of a locked rehabilitation ward, but it generally means
a hospital unit where patients are unable to leave as and when they want.
They're used to treat people who are considered high risk to others, so with
serious conditions such as psychosis
Answer:

The Trust has reviewed your request for information under the
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.
Section 1(1) of the FOI Act states:
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is
entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds
information of the description specified in the request, and
(b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to him.
East London NHS Foundation Trust does not have any “locked
rehabilitation” wards. We therefore do not hold the information
requested.
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