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I am responding to your request for information received 28 March 2023. This has been treated 
as a request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 
I am now enclosing a response, which is attached to the end of this letter. Please do not 
hesitate to contact me on the contact details above if you have any further queries. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 

 
Nimita Parmar 
Information Rights Coordinator 
 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Trust’s response to your FOIA request then you should contact us and we will arrange for an 
internal review of this decision.  
 
If you remain dissatisfied with the decision following our response to your complaint, you may write to the Information 
Commissioner for a decision under Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. The Information Commissioner can be 
contacted at:  
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
 
Tel: 0303 123 1113 
Web: www.ico.org.uk   
 
Please note that the data supplied is not allowed to be re-used and/or published without the explicit consent of 

East London NHS Foundation Trust.  Please contact the signatory to request permission if this is your intention 

mailto:elft.foi@nhs.net
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/
http://www.ico.org.uk/
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REQUEST: Enquiry for Community Stroke Rehabilitation team 
 
 
REHAB IN COMMUNITY SETTINGS -           
 
Question 1: Do you currently use a device for repetitive task training (RTT) as part of 

upper limb rehabilitation? If so, please indicate device name and 
supplier.  

 
Answer: No. 
 
Question 2. What is the average length of therapy per patient per session (in 

minutes)?  
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 2 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 3.    Do you monitor outcomes: intensity and adherence (%) for this type of  

therapy?     
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 4.    What are the limitations of current devices?             
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 4 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  
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Question 5.    What are the funding sources (Allocated budget? Spend limit before  
panel approval?) and procurement routes (direct purchase, rental, 
framework, tender…) for this type of rehabilitation devices?     

 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 5 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 6.    What are the criteria of selection for this type of devices?                  
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 6 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
REHAB AT HOME –  
 
Question 7.    Do you provide devices to patients for remotely monitored RTT at  

home? If not, please explain why?  
 
Answer: No. 
 
Question 8.    If yes, are these devices portable and would they be suitable for  

diverse environment (chair, table, wheelchair, or bed)?                
 
Answer: Not Applicable. 
 
Question 9.    Alternatively, do you recommend devices or services to patients, for  

home RTT therapy? If so, please indicate device name and supplier.  
 
Answer: No. 
 
Question 10.  What is the average length of therapy per patient per session (in  

minutes)?  
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 10 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
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(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 11.  Do you monitor outcomes: intensity and adherence (%) for this type of  

home therapy?           
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 11 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 12.  What are the limitations with current home devices?              
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 12 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 13.  What are the funding sources (Allocated budget? Spend limit before  

panel approval?) and procurement routes (direct purchase, rental, 
framework, tender…) for this type of home rehabilitation devices?  

 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 13 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
Question 14.  What are the criteria of selection for this type of devices?                    
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 14 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
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Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information 
of the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the information 
requested and is therefore unable to provide a response.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


