
As of December 2022

System: Rostering

For each of the staff group categories: Medical and Dental Nursing and HCAs AHPs and HSS

The Trust has reviewed question 1 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

Question 1. Does you Trust use an E-Rostering provider? (Yes/No)

The Trust has reviewed question 2 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here:

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

Question 2. What is the name of your E-Rostering provider?

Question 3. When was the contract for the software you currently use for E-Rostering signed? 
(dd/mm/yyyy)

Question 4. When does the contract for the software you currently use for E-Rostering expire? 
(dd/mm/yyyy)

Question 5. Was the e-rostering software procured through a framework?

The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
01/anon_response_-_foi_da3772.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 4 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 6 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here:

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
01/anon_response_-_foi_da3772.pdf
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Question 7. What was the Trust's total spend on E-Rostering fees in 2022 - not incl. 
Implementation?

Question 8. How many workers were actively E-Rostered at your Trust in 2022?

Question 10. Does the rostering system integrate to PAS?

Question 11. What system do you use for rota planning? E.g. eRota

Question 12. Who is the Senior Responsible Officer for E-Rostering?

System: Staff Bank

For each of the staff group categories: Medical and Dental Nursing and HCAs AHPs and HSS

HealthRoster

Question 6. What is the name of the framework the e-rostering software was procured using? 

The Trust has reviewed question 6 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
01/anon_response_-_foi_da3772.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 7 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
total spend of e-rostering fees excluding implementation 

and is therefore unable to provide a response.

5165 substantive staff are actively rostered.

The Trust has reviewed question 6 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
01/anon_response_-_foi_da3772.pdf

Question 9. Does the rostering system integrate to ESR?

No

Tanya Carter, Chief People Officer
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Question 15. If the software provider is not in the list - Please type

Question 16. Was the bank software procured through a framework?

The Trust has reviewed question 13 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 13. Do you have a staff bank tech provider? (Yes/No - if No, please provide more details).

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 14 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 14. What is the name of your staff bank tech provider?

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 15 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

The Trust has reviewed question 16 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.
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Question 17. What is the name of the framework the bank provider was procured using? 

Question 18.What was the contract signed date for the provider you currently use for your staff 
bank? (dd/mm/yyyy)

Question 19. What was the contract expiry date for the provider you currently use for your staff 
bank? (dd/mm/yyyy)

Question 20. What was the Trust's spend on bank staff wages in 2022? £4,153,722 14,514,088 9,478,069
Question 21. What was the Trust's spend on agency staff wages in 2022? 8,975,646 12,111,244.94 3,492,714

Question 22. What was the Trust's spend on its Staff Bank provider fees in 2022?

System: VMS (Vendor Management System)

For each of the staff group categories: Medical and Dental Nursing and HCAs AHPs and HSS

The Trust has reviewed question 22 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

The Trust has reviewed question 17 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

The Trust has reviewed question 18 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.

The Trust has reviewed question 19 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 
states:

 
Any person making a request for information to a public 

authority is entitled—
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority 

whether it holds information of the description specified in 
the request, and 

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information 
communicated to them.

East London NHS Foundation Trust does not record the 
information requested and is therefore unable to provide a 

response.



Question 27. What was the Trust's spend on its VMS provider fees in 2022?

VMS is an Agency Management Software

The Trust spend on VMS provider fees in 2022 was 
£416,827.65

The Trust has reviewed question 23 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

Question 23. Do you use a VMS provider? (Yes/No/Not Applicable)

The Trust has reviewed question 26 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 26. What is the contract expiry date for the provider you currently use? (dd/mm/yyyy)

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

The Trust has reviewed question 24 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
09/ANON%20Response%20-%20FOI%20DA4217.pdf

Question 24. What is the name of your VMS Provider?

The Trust has reviewed question 25 of your request for 
information under the Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 

2000. 

Section 21(1) of the FOI Act states:
(1)Information which is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant otherwise than under section 1 is exempt 

information.

The information requested is accessible here: 

Question 25. What was the contract signed date for the provider you currently use? (dd/mm/yyyy)

https://www.elft.nhs.uk/sites/default/files/2022-
01/anon_response_-_foi_da3772.pdf
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