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Our reference: FOI DA4752 
 
 
 
 
 
I am responding to your request for information received 19 May 2023 and clarified on 13 June 
2023.  This has been treated as a request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 
I am now enclosing a response which is attached to the end of this letter. Please do not hesitate 
to contact me on the contact details above if you have any further queries. 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
Information Rights Coordinator 
 
 
If you are dissatisfied with the Trust’s response to your FOIA request then you should contact us and we will arrange for an internal 
review of this decision.  
 
If you remain dissatisfied with the decision following our response to your complaint, you may write to the Information Commissioner 
for a decision under Section 50 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:  
 
Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
 
Tel: 0303 123 1113 
Web: www.ico.org.uk   
 
Please note that the data supplied is not allowed to be re-used and/or published without the explicit consent of East 
London NHS Foundation Trust.  Please contact the signatory to request permission if this is your intention 

mailto:elft.foi@nhs.net
https://www.elft.nhs.uk/
http://www.ico.org.uk/
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Request:  I would like to assess the rates of cancers in the East London before 2012  
the after 2012 in addition to mental health   

 

Question 1:  I would like to see what are the  
Numbers,  
percentage,  
ethnicity,  
gender  
from 2002 to 2012 first for the following:  
a) Skin cancer  
b) Lung Cancer 
c) Depression 
d) Anxiety 

Clarification: Could you please give me the required data for the following : Hackney wick, 
Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2002 to 2012 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: a) Skin cancer: 
 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 1a of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of 
the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community 
Health Trust and as such does not provide cancer services described in this 
request.  We are therefore unable to provide a response. 

 

Clarification - Could you please give me the required data for the following : Hackney wick, 
Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2002 to 2012 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: b) Lung cancer: 
 
Answer:  The Trust has reviewed question 1b of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 
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Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of 
the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community 
Health Trust and as such does not provide cancer services described in this 
request.  We are therefore unable to provide a response. 
 

Question 1c Clarification - Could you please give me the required data for the following : 
Hackney wick, Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, 
E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2002 to 2012 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: 1c) Depression  

Answer: Please see table below: 
 

 
2002-2012 - Depression (London Boroughs - E1, E9, E11, E12, 
E15, E20)  
Ethnicity Number of clients 

Asian or Asian British 43 

Asian or Asian British – 
Bangladeshi 

180 

Asian or Asian British - Indian 32 

Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 32 

Black or Black British - African 57 

Black or Black British – Any other 41 

Black or Black British - Caribbean 46 

Mixed - Any other mixed 
background 

14 

Mixed - White & Asian          8 

Mixed - White & Black African  3 

Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 10 

Not Known                      37 

Not Stated (Not Requested)     87 

Other Ethnic Groups - Any other 85 

Other Ethnic Groups - Chinese  3 

White - Any other background   117 

White - British                398 

White - Irish                  34 

Gender Number of clients 

Female  699 

Male 528 
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Please note, the Trust does not record population data for specific postcodes so 
will be unable to calculate the proportionate data.  
 

Question 1d Clarification - Could you please give me the required data for the following: 
Hackney wick, Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, 
E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2002 to 2012 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: 1d) Anxiety 

Answer: Please see table below:  
  

 
2002-2012 - Anxiety (London Boroughs - E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, 
E20)  
Ethnicity Number of clients 

Asian or Asian British - Any other 5 

Asian or Asian British - 
Bangladeshi 17 

Asian or Asian British - Indian 1 

Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 1 

Black or Black British - African 4 

Black or Black British - Any other 3 

Black or Black British - Caribbean 3 

Mixed - Any other mixed  
background 1 

Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 2 

Not Known                      4 

Not Stated (Not Requested)    11 

Other Ethnic Groups - Any other 9 

White - Any other background   19 

White - British                48 

White - Irish                  5 

Gender Number of clients 

Female  84 

Male 49 

 
Please note, the Trust does not record population data for specific postcodes so 
will be unable to calculate the proportionate data.  

Question 2: I would like to have the same information (Numbers, percentage, ethnicity, 
gender) from 2012 to 2022 in East London : 
a) Skin cancer  
b) Lungs cancer 
c) Depression  
d) Anxiety 
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Clarification: Could you please give me the required data for the following : Hackney Wick,  
Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2012 to 2022 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
for the following: 2a) Skin cancer  
 

Answer:  The Trust has reviewed question 2a of your request for information under the 
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of 
the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 

East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community 
Health Trust and as such does not provide cancer services described in this 
request.  We are therefore unable to provide a response. 

Clarification: Could you please give me the required data for the following : Hackney Wick, 
Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2012 to 2022 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: 2b) Lung cancer  
 

Answer:  The Trust has reviewed question 2b of your request for information under the 
Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of 
the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 

East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community 
Health Trust and as such does not provide cancer services described in this 
request.  We are therefore unable to provide a response. 

Clarification: Could you please give me the required data for the following : Hackney Wick,  
Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, E20). 

 
I would like to see from 2012 to 2022 what are the 

• Numbers 
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• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: 2c) Depression  
 
Answer:  Please see table below:  
 

 
2012-2022 - Depression (London Boroughs - E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, 
E20)  
Ethnicity Number of clients 

Asian or Asian British 94 

Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 395 

Asian or Asian British - Indian 66 

Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 71 

Black or Black British - African 93 

Black or Black British – Any other 87 

Black or Black British - Caribbean 76 

Mixed - Any other mixed background 31 

Mixed - White & Asian          8 

Mixed - White & Black African  4 

Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 13 

Not Known                      106 

Not Stated (Not Requested)     73 

Other Ethnic Groups - Any other 168 

Other Ethnic Groups - Chinese  16 

White - Any other background   181 

White - British                513 

White - Irish                  31 

Gender Number of clients 

Female  1144 

Male 882 

 
Please note, the Trust does not record population data for specific postcodes so 
will be unable to calculate the proportionate data.  

 
Clarification: Could you please give me the required data for the following : Hackney Wick,  

Newham and Tower hamlets boroughs (E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, E20). 
 

I would like to see from 2012 to 2022 what are the 

• Numbers 

• Percentage (Clarification - I mean by percentage, the rate / proportion/ 
fraction of the data asked for, compared to the whole population of the 
same areas) 

• Ethnicity 

• Gender  
 

for the following: 2d) Anxiety 
 
Answer:  Please see table below: 
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2012-2022 - Anxiety (London Boroughs - E1, E9, E11, E12, E15, 
E20)  
Ethnicity Number of clients 

Asian or Asian British - Any other 18 

Asian or Asian British –  
Bangladeshi 56 

Asian or Asian British - Indian 18 

Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 15 

Black or Black British - African 15 

Black or Black British - Any other 8 

Black or Black British - Caribbean 11 

Mixed - Any other mixed  
background 14 

Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 3 

Not Known                      18 

Not Stated (Not Requested)  17 

Other Ethnic Groups - Any other 36 

White - Any other background   58 

White - British                130 

White - Irish                  6 

Mixed - White & Asian          3 

Mixed - White & Black African  1 

Gender Number of clients 

Female  277 

Male 149 

Unknown 1 

 
Please note, the Trust does not record population data for specific postcodes so 
will be unable to calculate the proportionate data.  

 
Question 3:  The last information I would like to have access to is the rate of deaths 

amongst people having cancer in East London between: 
2002 to 2012 
2012 to 2022 

 
Answer: The Trust has reviewed question 3 of your request for information under the 

Freedom of Information Act (FOI) 2000.  
 
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 states: 

  
Any person making a request for information to a public authority is entitled— 
(a) to be informed in writing by the public authority whether it holds information of 
the description specified in the request, and  

  (b) if that is the case, to have that information communicated to them. 
 

East London NHS Foundation Trust is primarily a Mental Health and Community 
Health Trust and as such does not record cancer death rates.  We are therefore 
unable to provide a response. 


